
Premium Custom Printed Square Hinged Lid Candy Tin Box

Elevate your brand & delight your customers with our high-quality, durable Square Hinged Lid
Candy Tin Boxes. Perfect for packaging premium candies, chocolates, cookies, teas, gifts, or
promotional items, these tins offer exceptional protection and a touch of class.

Key Features:

Custom Printed Designs: Showcase your unique brand identity! We offer full-color, high-
definition offset or digital printing directly onto the tinplate. Create eye-catching designs,
logos, and artwork to make your product stand out on the shelf.

Convenient Hinged Lid: The integrated hinge ensures the lid stays securely attached,
preventing loss and offering a smooth, premium opening and closing experience for the end
user.

Classic Square Shape: A timeless and versatile shape that maximizes space efficiency for
packing, shipping, and retail display. Provides a stable, stackable base.

Durable Tinplate Construction: Made from high-quality, food-grade tinplate steel, ensuring
excellent protection for your contents against moisture, light, and air, preserving freshness
and flavor. Rigid and robust for secure transport.

Superior Finish Options: Choose from a high-gloss, matte, or textured finish to perfectly
complement your design and brand aesthetic. Includes smooth, rolled edges for safety.

Wide Range of Applications: Ideal not just for candies and confectionery, but also for
gourmet snacks, tea, coffee, cosmetics, gifts, collectibles, crafts, and corporate promotional
items.

Food-Safe & Eco-Friendly: Manufactured using food-safe materials and inks. Tinplate is
highly recyclable, supporting sustainable packaging initiatives.

Your Reliable Source:

Expert China Guangdong Custom Candy Tin Box Manufacturer: We are a leading
manufacturer based in the heart of Guangdong's manufacturing hub, specializing in crafting
bespoke tin packaging solutions to your exact specifications.

Competitive Shenzhen Candy Tin Box Wholesale: Offering exceptional value for bulk
orders. Our efficient production and logistics network, centered in Shenzhen, ensures
competitive wholesale pricing and reliable supply for businesses of all sizes.

https://www.tinpackagebox.com/product/Custom-Printed-Square-Hinged-Lid-Candy-Tin-Box.html
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Quality-Focused Guangdong Candy Tin Box Producer: Committed to stringent quality
control throughout the manufacturing process, from material sourcing to final inspection,
guaranteeing a premium product that reflects well on your brand.

Customization Options:

Sizes: Available in a wide range of sizes (  or custom dimensions).

Finishes: Glossy, Matte, Hammered Texture, etc.

Lining: Optional food-safe paper or PE plastic linings available.

Minimum Order Quantity (MOQ): Competitive MOQs suitable for startups and established
brands. Contact us for details.

Ideal For:

Confectionery Brands (Chocolates, Gummies, Hard Candies)

Gourmet Food Producers (Cookies, Biscuits, Nuts, Tea)

Gift & Souvenir Companies

Cosmetic & Toiletry Brands

Corporate Promotional Items

Event Favors & Wedding Bonbonnieres

Hobby & Craft Supplies

Partner with us, your trusted Guangdong candy tin box manufacturer, for Shenzhen candy
tin box wholesale excellence. We deliver innovative, high-quality, custom printed
packaging solutions that enhance your product and brand value.

Request a quote today for your Custom Printed Square Hinged Lid Candy Tin Box needs!
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