
As a leading china rectangle tin box factory, we prioritize quality and precision to meet your
bespoke packaging needs.
Elevate your packaging with our high-quality rectangular tin box, meticulously designed for both
aesthetics and functionality. Made from top-grade tinplate, this 180x105x32mm Tin box offers
exceptional sturdiness and a refined appearance, making it ideal for gourmet foods, cosmetics, gifts,
and premium retail products.

Our expertise as a shenzhen rectangle metal box wholesaler ensures that every detail, from the
smooth edges to the flawless print, reflects superior craftsmanship. Customization is
effortless—adjust the dimensions, shape, or opt for advanced printing techniques like CMYK, UV, or
silk-screen to match your brand’s identity.

https://www.tinpackagebox.com/product/Custom-Rectangle-Biscuit-Tin-Container-Cookie-Chocolate-Tin-Box.html
https://www.tinpackagebox.com/product/Custom-Rectangle-Biscuit-Tin-Container-Cookie-Tin-Box.html




Whether you seek sleek minimalism or intricate designs, our team delivers precision and creativity.
Trusted as a reliable dongguan rectangle tin container supplier, we combine innovation with
durability to provide packaging solutions that stand out. Perfect for businesses seeking elegance,
sustainability, and unmatched quality.

https://www.tinpackagebox.com/product/Custom-Rectangle-Biscuit-Tin-Container-Cookie-Tin-Box-Playing-Cards-Packaging.html












 

FAQ

1. Are you a factory or trading company ?

We are a professional manufacturer of tin box since 2002, and we also experienced in marketing
related packaging products, such as aluminum tin, paper box, glass jar/bottle etc.

2. What are your main strengths?

Since 2002, we specialize in tin box manufacturing and marketing, professional quality control
production lines, mature supply chain can achieve one-stop service, in Europe and the Netherlands
also have branches. Working with more than 50 international freight forwarding companies, we have
established good partnerships with hundreds of customers from more than 50 countries.

3. What is the unit price and shipping cost?

Pls let us know the quantity you need, so we can give you maximum discount accordingly. Pls let us
know if you have any customization request, such as private label, silk printing/emboss logo, inner
tray. For the shipping cost, pls kindly advise the destination address, and your expected delivery
time.

4. Can I get a sample? What is the sample cost & lead time?

Sure. Our stock sample is free, customer just need to pay the delivery cost, and we will send out in
1~5 days.

If you want to get a sample with customized logo, there will be proofing fee, which will be refund if



the mass production order reach to the quantity we agreed, it takes about 10 days for sample
making.

5. Is your tin box safe for food? Can it pass food garde test?

Our tin box is made of high quality tinplate material which is coated with a food grade lacquer
inside, it is a very safe pacakging material for food items, such as biscuit, chocalate, candy, tea leaf,
spice etc. Our tin box can pass LFGB, SVHC REACH, SGS test, if you need to do a testing, we can
support.

6. What file you need to customize my logo? How can I send you my logo?

Usually high resolution AI or PDF file is required, or you can send us what you have and we can help
design for free. Pls contact us and send us your logo directly, and we can also provide our email
address.

7. Is the price on the website reliable? How to get the real best price?

For ready to ship products, the price showing means stock items without any custom. If you need
quick custom or want to get a better price, please tell us your custom request and the size, color &
quantity you need. For customized products, as the price will much differ from different
customization & quantity, the price showing doesn't mean much, please tell us all your custom
request, and the quantity you need to get the real best price.


